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My topic for today is the danger of increasing the number of people traveling and the
problem that is created for the environment. Travel is good and if tourists behaved in a
civilized way I do not think that there would be significant problems for the environment.
but this is not so, many tourists are far from education and behave disgustingly staying in
another country, at least because they litter creates problems for the environment. In my
opinion, there is a way to deal with this, introduce a fine and carefully monitor that the
order is not violated. People can also be carriers of the disease, in our time we are faced
with a coronavirus that has spread rapidly around the world and the main reason is again
tourists. Even now I know people who, despite the situation in the country, ignore the
rules. I will give an example; my friends are going to go to Egypt for the New Year. to do
this, you need a certificate that you are healthy. The certificate will be active for three
days, which is very inconvenient, especially when you have two children. Therefore, they
want to buy these certificates, as there is such a service, I think many people use it. And I
can't blame them for this, because they just want to relax, I think such a question should
be dealt with by travel agencies from which they buy a ticket or the airport could do such
a service so that people buying tickets do not think about how they would have time to
make a certificate in time. One way or another, the fact remains that people want to rest,
but the fact that they can become various diseases is of little concern to them. Another
problem is fuel, I am not well versed in airplanes, but I know for sure that they do not
benefit nature. On the contrary, they pollute the air. These problems can be dealt with,
but how to do it gradually is difficult for me to imagine, but if all the borders were closed
and no one was allowed anywhere, tourists would definitely cease to be a threat to the
environment.

In conclusion, I want to say that the tourist is each of us, it is worth just thinking, we are a
living organism, and nature is the same living organism as we are. We must respect
nature and not harm it. And you should also respect a foreign country and especially their
culture. After all, there is a red book that protects endangered plants for a reason. We are
obliged to take care not only of the purity of the nature of our city, but also take care of
the city in which we are staying as a tourist.
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